PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR LOW VALUE PERSONAL INJURY (EMPLOYERS’
LIABILITY AND PUBLIC LIABILITY) CLAIMS

AND

PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR RESOLUTION OF PACKAGE TRAVEL CLAIMS

The Master of the Rolls as Head of Civil Justice approves the amendments to—

(a) the Pre-Action Protocol for Low Value Personal Injury (Employers’ Liability and
Public Liability) Claims; and

(b) the Pre-Action Protocol for Resolution of Package Travel Claims.

Subject to the transitional and saving provision at the end of this instrument, the
amendments made by this instrument come into force on 6™ April 2022,

Signed by:

The Right Honourable Sir Geoffrey Vos
Master of the Rolls

Date: 1% April 2022

PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR LOW VALUE PERSONAL INJURY (EMPLOYERS’
LIABILITY AND PUBLIC LIABILITY) CLAIMS

1) After paragraph 4.1(4), in the words in parenthesis, for “£1,000” substitute “£1,500”.

2) In paragraph 5.9, for “€1,000” substitute “£1,500".

PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR RESOLUTION OF PACKAGE TRAVEL CLAIMS



1) After paragraph 4.1(5), in the words in parenthesis, for “is more than £1,000”, substitute

“, other than a claim arising from a road traffic accident, is more than £1,500”.

TRANSITIONAL AND SAVING PROVISION

1) The amendments made by this instrument apply to claims where either—
a) the date on which the cause of action accrues; or
b) the date of knowledge of the person injured,

is on or after 6th April 2022.



